
FURNITURE FURNITURE

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL

1 BENCH NO BACK 6 BN-1 1,378.80                             8,272.80          1 BENCH NO BACK 6 BN-1 NO BID

2 BENCH LOW BACK 3 BN-2 2,471.64                             7,414.92          2 BENCH LOW BACK 3 BN-2 NO BID

3 OTTOMAN 2 BN-3A 474.25                                948.50            3 OTTOMAN 2 BN-3A NO BID

4 OTTOMAN 1 BN-3B 605.44                                605.44            4 OTTOMAN 1 BN-3B NO BID

5 OTTOMAN 3 BN-4 479.92                                1,439.76          5 OTTOMAN 3 BN-4 NO BID

6 OTTOMAN 3 BN-5 479.92                                1,439.76          6 OTTOMAN 3 BN-5 NO BID

7 OTTOMAN 1 BN-6A 655.49                                655.49            7 OTTOMAN 1 BN-6A NO BID

8 OTTOMAN 1 BN-6B 675.71                                675.71            8 OTTOMAN 1 BN-6B NO BID

9 OTTOMAN 1 BN-7 505.22                                505.22            9 OTTOMAN 1 BN-7 NO BID

11 TASK CHAIR 20 CH-1A 773.30                                15,466.00        11 TASK CHAIR 20 CH-1A NO BID

10 TASK CHAIR 4 CH-1B 762.78                                3,051.12          10 TASK CHAIR 4 CH-1B NO BID

12 STACKING CHAIR 175 CH-2 105.10                                18,392.50        12 STACKING CHAIR 175 CH-2 NO BID

13 MULTIPURPOSE CHAIR 4 CH-3 182.63                                730.52            13 MULTIPURPOSE CHAIR 4 CH-3 NO BID

14 TASK STOOL 4 CH-4A 705.35                                2,821.40          14 TASK STOOL 4 CH-4A NO BID

15 TASK STOOL 1 CH-4B 752.95                                752.95            15 TASK STOOL 1 CH-4B NO BID

16 LOUNGE CHAIR 3 CH-5A 1,160.36                             3,481.08          16 LOUNGE CHAIR 3 H-5A NO BID

17 LOUNGE CHAIR 12 CH-5B 1,276.61                             15,319.32        17 LOUNGE CHAIR 12 CH-5B NO BID

18 LOUNGE CHAIR 3 CH-6 1,273.52                             3,820.56          18 LOUNGE CHAIR 3 CH-5A NO BID

19 LOUNGE CHAIR 8 CH-7 1,617.31                             12,938.48        19 LOUNGE CHAIR 12 CH-5B NO BID

20 LOUNGE CHAIR 4 CH-8 839.47                                3,357.88          20 LOUNGE CHAIR 3 CH-6 NO BID

23 TASK CHAIR 6 CH-9 751.87                                4,511.22          23 TASK CHAIR 6 CH-9 NO BID

24 CREDENZA 2 CZ-1 3,668.57                             7,337.14          24 CREDENZA 2 CZ-1 NO BID

25 DOLLY 5 DO-1 171.50                                857.50            25 DOLLY 5 DO-1 NO BID

26 DESK, FREESTANDING WORKWALL 1 DSK-1 10,037.60                           10,037.60        26 DESK, FREESTANDING WORKWALL 1 DSK-1 NO BID

27 DESK FREESTANDING L-SHAPE 2 DSK-2A 4,063.31                             8,126.62          27 DESK FREESTANDING L-SHAPE 2 DSK-2A NO BID

28 DESK FREESTANDING L-SHAPE 1 DSK-2B 4,367.66                             4,367.66          28 DESK FREESTANDING L-SHAPE 1 DSK-2B NO BID

29 DESK FREESTANDING L-SHAPE 1 DSK-2C 5,139.49                             5,139.49          29 DESK FREESTANDING L-SHAPE 1 DSK-2C NO BID

30 DESK FREESTANDING U-SHAPE 1 DSK-3 5,142.32                             5,142.32          30 DESK FREESTANDING U-SHAPE 1 DSK-3 NO BID

31 BENCHING WORKSTATION 1 DSK-4 8,178.34                             8,178.34          31 BENCHING WORKSTATION 1 DSK-4 NO BID

32 MOBILE DISPLAY SHELVING 1 DSP-1 3,100.00                             3,100.00          32 MOBILE DISPLAY SHELVING 1 DSP-1 1,865.00                             1,865.00       

33 MOBILE CREDENZA 1 MCZ-1 2,757.08                             2,757.08          33 MOBILE CREDENZA 1 MCZ-1 NO BID

34 MOBILE MARKER BOARD 5 MKB-1 833.47                                4,167.35          34 MOBILE MARKER BOARD 5 MKB-1 NO BID

35 MOBILE STORAGE STOOL 4 ST-1 622.76                                2,491.04          35 MOBILE STORAGE STOOL 4 ST-1 NO BID

36 BAR HEIGHT STOOL 11 ST-2 808.71                                8,895.81          36 BAR HEIGHT STOOL 11 ST-2 NO BID

37 COUNTER HEIGHT STOOL 4 ST-3 808.71                                3,234.84          37 COUNTER HEIGHT STOOL 4 ST-3 NO BID

38 FLIP NEST TABLE 14 TB-1 1,243.33                             17,406.62        38 FLIP NEST TABLE 14 TB-1 NO BID

39 COFFEE TABLE ROUND 6 TB-2A 541.44                                3,248.64          39 COFFEE TABLE ROUND 6 TB-2A NO BID

40 COFFEE TABLE ROUND 1 TB-2B 541.44                                541.44            40 COFFEE TABLE ROUND 1 TB-2B NO BID

41 BAR HEIGHT TABLE 2 TB-4 1,859.38                             3,718.76          41 BAR HEIGHT TABLE 2 TB-4 NO BID

42 PULL UP TABLE 8 TB-5A 365.97                                2,927.76          42 PULL UP TABLE 8 TB-5A NO BID

43 PULL UP TABLE 2 TB-5B 311.19                                622.38            43 PULL UP TABLE 2 TB-5B NO BID

44 VERTICAL FILE CABINET 9 VF-1 229.09                                2,061.81          44 VERTICAL FILE CABINET 9 VF-1 NO BID

SUBTOTAL 210,960.83     SUBTOTAL 1,865.00       

SHELVING ACCESSORIES SHELVING ACCESSORIES

45 COMMON TOP 2 CT1 442.26                                884.52            45 COMMON TOP 2 CT1 409.00                                818.00          

46 COMMON TOP 4 CT-2 502.20                                2,008.80          46 COMMON TOP 4 CT-2 465.00                                1,860.00       

47 COMMON TOP 1 CT-3 741.96                                741.96            47 COMMON TOP 1 CT-3 687.00                                687.00          

48 COMMON TOP 7 CT-4 442.26                                3,095.82          48 COMMON TOP 7 CT-4 409.50                                2,866.50       

49 COMMON TOP 2 CT-5 471.96                                943.92            49 COMMON TOP 2 CT-5 437.00                                874.00          

50 COMMON TOP 1 CT-6 1,379.70                             1,379.70          50 COMMON TOP 1 CT-6 1,295.00                             1,295.00       

51 COMMON TOP 1 CT-7 337.50                                337.50            51 COMMON TOP 1 CT-7 312.50                                312.50          

52 COMMON TOP 1 CT-8 741.96                                741.96            52 COMMON TOP 1 CT-8 687.00                                687.00          

SUBTOTAL 10,134.18       SUBTOTAL 9,400.00       

FURNITURE SUBTOTAL 210,960.83      53 FURNITURE SUBTOTAL 1,865.00       

SHELVING SUBTOTAL 10,134.18        54 SHELVING SUBTOTAL 9,401.00       

FREIGHT 1,559.16          FREIGHT -                

INSTALLATION 12,500.00        INSTALLATION 2,850.00       

GRAND TOTAL 235,154.17     GRAND TOTAL 14,116.00     

ALTERNATE 1 ALTERNATE 1

1 STACKING CHAIR 175 CH-2 105.10                                18,392.50        1 STACKING CHAIR 175 CH-2 NO BID

2 DOLLY 5 DO-1 171.50                                857.50            2 DOLLY 5 DO-1 NO BID

3 FLIP-NEST TABLE 75 TB-1 1,243.33                             93,249.75        3 FLIP-NEST TABLE 75 TB-1 NO BID

SUBTOTAL 112,499.75      SUBTOTAL

FREIGHT -                  FREIGHT -                

INSTALLATION 2,565.00          INSTALLATION

GRAND TOTAL 115,064.75$   GRAND TOTAL NO BID

ALTERNATE 2 ALTERNATE 2

1 MOBILE MARKER BOARD 4 MKB-1 833.47                                3,333.88          1 MOBILE MARKER BOARD 4 MKB-1 NO BID

SUBTOTAL 3,333.88          SUBTOTAL

FREIGHT -                  FREIGHT -                

INSTALLATION 275.00            INSTALLATION

GRAND TOTAL 3,608.88$       GRAND TOTAL NO BID

ALTERNATE 3 ALTERNATE 3

1 TRASH RECEPTACLE 6 TC-1 276.67                                1,660.02          1 TRASH RECEPTACLE 6 TC-1 NO BID

2 TRASH RECEPTACLE 7 TC-2 500.00                                3,500.00          2 TRASH RECEPTACLE 7 TC-2 NO BID

3 TRASH RECEPTACLE 6 TC-3 540.00                                3,240.00          3 TRASH RECEPTACLE 6 TC-3 NO BID

SUBTOTAL 8,400.02          SUBTOTAL

FREIGHT 522.86            FREIGHT

INSTALLATION 350.00            INSTALLATION

GRAND TOTAL 9,272.88$       GRAND TOTAL NO BID

ALTERNATE 4 ALTERNATE 4

1 VERTICAL FILE CABINET 9 VF-1 229.09                                2,061.81          1 VERTICAL FILE CABINET 9 VF-1 NO BID

SUBTOTAL 2,061.81          SUBTOTAL

FREIGHT -                  FREIGHT -                

INSTALLATION 1,250.00          INSTALLATION

GRAND TOTAL 3,311.81$       GRAND TOTAL NO BID

ALTERNATE 5 ALTERNATE 5

1 MOBILE DISPLAY SHELVING 2 DSP-1 3,100.00                             6,200.00          1 MOBILE DISPLAY SHELVING 2 DSP-1 1,865.00                             3,730.00       

SUBTOTAL 6,200.00          SUBTOTAL 3,730.00       

FREIGHT -                  FREIGHT -                

INSTALLATION 450.00            INSTALLATION 550.00          

GRAND TOTAL 6,650.00$       GRAND TOTAL 4,280.00$     

CORRECTED BY PURCHASING AGENT.  SUBMITTED BID DOCUMENT CONTAINED ERRORS.  ERRORS WERE

WITHIN THE ALTERNATE PRICING SHEET AND DO NOT AFFECT THE AWARD OF THE BID.

CHOSEN ALTERNATES

ALTERNATE 1

3 FLIP-NEST TABLE 6 TB-1 1,243.33                             7,459.98          

ALTERNATE 2

1 MOBILE MARKER BOARD 4 MKB-1 833.47                                3,333.88          

SUBTOTAL 3,333.88          

FREIGHT -                  

INSTALLATION 275.00            

GRAND TOTAL 3,608.88$       

ALTERNATE 4

1 VERTICAL FILE CABINET 9 VF-1 229.09                                2,061.81          

SUBTOTAL 2,061.81          

FREIGHT -                  

INSTALLATION 1,250.00          

GRAND TOTAL 3,311.81$       

ALTERNATE 5

1 MOBILE DISPLAY SHELVING 2 DSP-1 3,100.00                             6,200.00          

SUBTOTAL 6,200.00          

FREIGHT -                  

INSTALLATION 450.00            

GRAND TOTAL 6,650.00$       

FINAL TOTAL INCLUDING ALTERNATES 256,184.84$   
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