

GLYNN COUNTY SHERIFF'S COMPLEX
 FURNITURE IFB# 00895
 FEBRUARY 3, 2014

Award Date: 3/24/2014
 Awarded to: Items 1-4, 16, 20, 28, 29, 32 Total Office Solutions
 Items 5-13, 15, 17-19, 22, 24, 31 Holmes and Brakel
 Items 14, 21, 23, 25 Georgia Correctional Industries
 Items 30 VIP Office Furniture and Supply

ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	QTY	HOLMES AND BRAKEL			GEORGIA		TOTAL OFFICE SOLUTIONS			THE OFFICE LEADER		VIP OFFICE FURNITURE &		
			UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED COST	WITH INSTALLATION	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED COST	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED COST	WITH 1% DISCOUNT	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED COST	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED COST	WITH 1% DISCOUNT
1	Specification #: G-100 - L-Shaped Desk	35	\$549.00	\$19,215.00	\$24,465.00	\$682.00	\$23,870.00	\$324.20	\$11,347.00	\$11,233.53	\$434.65	\$15,212.75	\$809.50	\$28,332.50	\$28,049.18
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			Lacasse			Same Item		Offices to Go			CUSTOM-SEE		Hon		
2	Specification #: G-101 - Bow Front Executive Desk	5	\$1,295.00	\$6,475.00	\$7,225.00	\$1,087.00	\$5,435.00	\$531.48	\$2,657.40	\$2,630.83	\$1,321.65	\$6,608.25	\$1,615.00	\$8,075.00	\$7,994.25
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			Lacasse			Same Item		Offices to Go			CUSTOM-SEE		Hon		
3	Specification #: G-102 - Straight Basic Desk	11	\$335.00	\$3,685.00	\$4,895.00	\$533.00	\$5,863.00	\$242.91	\$2,672.01	\$2,645.29	\$331.65	\$3,648.15	\$584.50	\$6,429.50	\$6,365.21
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			Lacasse			Same Item		Offices to Go			CUSTOM-SEE		Hon		
4	Specification #G-103 - Training Lectern	1	\$260.00	\$260.00	\$285.00	\$475.00	\$475.00	\$282.45	\$282.45	\$279.63	\$329.65	\$329.65	\$389.50	\$389.50	\$385.61
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			Lacasse			Same Item		Global Total Office			CUSTOM-SEE		Hon		
5	Specification #G-200 - General Office Chair	48	\$302.00	\$14,496.00	\$15,168.00	\$485.00	\$23,280.00	\$455.02	\$21,840.96	\$21,622.55	\$518.65	\$24,895.20	\$495.13	\$23,766.24	\$23,528.58
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			United			Same Item		Global Total Office			Same Item		Same Item		
6	Specification #G-201 - Executive Task Chair	4	\$412.75	\$1,651.00	\$1,707.00	\$625.00	\$2,500.00	\$556.23	\$2,224.92	\$2,202.67	\$588.65	\$2,354.60	\$671.75	\$2,687.00	\$2,660.13
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			Same item			Same Item		Global Total Office			Same Item		Same Item		
7	Specification #: G-202 - Judge/Courtroom Executive Task Chair	1	\$442.00	\$442.00	\$456.00	\$625.00	\$625.00	\$556.23	\$556.23	\$550.67	\$588.65	\$588.65	\$671.75	\$671.75	\$665.03
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			Same item			Same Item		Global Total Office			Same Item		Same Item		
8	Specification #: G-203 - Sheriff's Conference Room Task Chair	10	\$442.00	\$4,420.00	\$4,560.00	\$625.00	\$6,250.00	\$556.23	\$5,562.30	\$5,506.68	\$588.65	\$5,886.50	\$671.75	\$6,717.50	\$6,650.33
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			Same item			Same Item		Global Total Office			Same Item		Same Item		
9	Specification #: G-300 - Polypropylene Stack Chair	29	\$48.00	\$1,392.00	\$1,682.00	\$65.00	\$1,885.00	\$71.80	\$2,082.20	\$2,061.38	NO BID		\$74.00	\$2,146.00	\$2,124.54
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			United			Same Item		Global Total Office					Hon		
10	Specification #: G-301 - Fabric Stack Chair	16	\$161.19	\$2,579.04	\$2,750.40	\$145.00	\$2,320.00	\$268.60	\$4,297.60	\$4,254.62	NO BID		\$74.00	\$1,184.00	\$1,172.16
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			United			Same Item		Global Total Office					Hon		
11	Specification #: G-400 - General Office Guest Chair	56	\$156.00	\$8,736.00	\$9,520.00	\$195.00	\$10,920.00	\$241.79	\$13,540.24	\$13,404.84	\$248.65	\$13,924.40	\$263.50	\$14,756.00	\$14,608.44
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			United			Same Item		Global Total Office			Same Item		Same Item		
12	Specification #: G-401 - Executive Office Guest Chair	8	\$136.00	\$1,088.00	\$1,168.00	\$185.00	\$1,480.00	\$234.43	\$1,875.44	\$1,856.69	\$228.65	\$1,829.20	\$263.50	\$2,108.00	\$2,086.92
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			United			Same Item		Global Total Office			Same Item		Same Item		
13	Specification #: G-402 - Sheriff's Office Guest Chair	2	\$322.00	\$644.00	\$664.00	\$575.00	\$1,150.00	\$435.99	\$871.98	\$863.26	NO BID		\$597.00	\$1,194.00	\$1,182.06
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			Aroid			Same Item		Global Total Office					Same Item		

14	Specification #: G-403 - Sheriff's Office Guest Sofa	1	2	\$1,178.00	\$1,178.00	\$1,253.00	\$975.00	\$975.00	\$1,580.97	\$1,580.97	\$1,565.16	NO BID	\$1,735.00	\$1,735.00	\$1,717.65	
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			Arold			Same Item			HCL -H Signature Collection			Same Item				
15	Specification #: G-404 - Courtroom and Judge Guest Chair	8	1	\$124.00	\$992.00	\$1,072.00	\$210.00	\$1,680.00	\$314.01	\$2,512.08	\$2,486.96	\$248.65	\$1,989.20	\$263.50	\$2,108.00	\$2,086.92
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			United			Same Item			Global Total Office			Same Item				
16	Specification #: G-600 - Cubicle and Training Task Chair	78	2	\$114.00	\$8,892.00	\$9,984.00	\$155.00	\$12,090.00	\$125.43	\$9,783.54	\$9,685.70	\$129.65	\$10,112.70	\$201.00	\$15,678.00	\$15,521.22
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			United			Same Item			Global Total Office			Same Item				
17	Specification #: G-601 - 24/7 Heavy Duty Task Chair	21	1	\$205.00	\$4,305.00	\$4,599.00	\$725.00	\$15,225.00	\$547.64	\$11,500.44	\$11,385.44	\$652.65	\$13,705.65	\$748.00	\$15,708.00	\$15,550.92
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			United			Same Item			VIA			Same Item				
18	Specification #: G-602 - Sherman Stool -with arms	2	1	\$408.00	\$816.00	\$844.00	\$575.00	\$1,150.00	\$615.46	\$1,230.92	\$1,218.61	\$584.65	\$1,169.30	\$667.25	\$1,334.50	\$1,321.16
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			Arold			Same Item			VIA			Same Item				
19	Specification #: G-602 - Sherman Stool -without arms	6	1	\$340.00	\$2,040.00	\$2,124.00	\$550.00	\$3,300.00	\$495.96	\$2,975.76	\$2,946.00	\$530.65	\$3,183.90	\$601.38	\$3,608.28	\$3,572.20
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			Arold			Same Item			VIA			Same Item				
20	Specification #: G-603 - Medical Stool	1	2	\$121.88	\$121.88	\$131.88	\$135.00	\$135.00	\$128.89	\$128.89	\$127.60	NO BID	\$159.38	\$159.38	\$157.79	
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			United			Same Item			Global Total Office			Same Item				
21	Specification #: G-700 - Work Tables	10	3	\$188.00	\$1,880.00	\$2,180.00	\$155.00	\$1,550.00	\$284.66	\$2,846.60	\$2,818.13	NO BID	\$191.00	\$1,910.00	\$1,890.90	
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			Lacasse			Same Item			Special T			Hon				
22	Specification #: G-701 - Computer Table	2	1	\$269.00	\$538.00	\$598.00	\$825.00	\$1,650.00	\$346.02	\$692.04	\$685.12	NO BID	\$345.00	\$690.00	\$683.10	
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			Lacasse			Same Item			Special T			Hon				
23	Specification #: G-702 - Break Room Table	4	4	\$289.00	\$1,156.00	\$1,276.00	\$165.00	\$660.00	\$232.53	\$930.12	\$920.82	NO BID	\$221.50	\$886.00	\$877.14	
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			Lacasse			Same Item			Special T			Hon				
24	Specification #: G-703 - Sheriff's Office Side Table	2	1	\$263.00	\$526.00	\$584.00	\$950.00	\$1,900.00	\$911.42	\$1,822.84	\$1,804.61	NO BID	\$878.00	\$1,756.00	\$1,738.44	
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			Arold			Same Item			HCL Contract			Same Item				
25	Specification #: G-704 - Nurse Work Table	1	4	\$212.00	\$212.00	\$239.00	\$125.00	\$125.00	\$205.31	\$205.31	\$203.26	NO BID	\$156.00	\$156.00	\$154.44	
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			Lacasse			Same Item			Special T			Hon				
26	Specification #: G-705 - Courtroom Table	2	1	\$250.00	\$500.00	\$548.00	\$515.00	\$1,030.00	\$635.76	\$1,271.52	\$1,258.80	NO BID	\$826.50	\$1,653.00	\$1,636.47	
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			Global			Same Item			Special T			Hon				
27	Specification #: G-706 - Training Tables	16	1	\$295.00	\$4,720.00	\$5,120.00	\$550.00	\$8,800.00	\$619.15	\$9,906.40	\$9,807.34	NO BID	\$811.00	\$12,976.00	\$12,846.24	
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			Global			Same Item			Special T			Hon				
28	Specification #: G-800 - 5 Shelf Bookcase	16	2	\$201.00	\$3,216.00	\$3,856.00	\$305.00	\$4,880.00	\$146.39	\$2,342.24	\$2,318.82	\$249.65	\$3,994.40	\$349.00	\$5,584.00	\$5,528.16
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			Lacasse			Same Item			Offices to Go			CUSTOM -SEE				
29	Specification #: G-801 - 3 Shelf Bookcase	1	3	\$203.00	\$203.00	\$243.00	\$255.00	\$255.00	\$77.73	\$77.73	\$76.95	\$169.65	\$169.65	\$249.50	\$249.50	\$247.01
ALTERNATE (IF ANY)			Lacasse			Same Item			Offices to Go			CUSTOM -SEE				
30	Specification #: G-900 - Open Shelving	11	4	\$300.00	\$3,300.00	\$4,653.00	\$240.00	\$2,640.00	\$323.50	\$3,558.50	\$3,522.92	NO BID	\$189.00	\$2,079.00	\$2,058.21	

ALTERNATE (IF ANY)		
31	Specification #: G-901 - 5 Drawer Lateral File	22

ALTERNATE (IF ANY)		
32	Specification #: G-902 - 4 Drawer Vertical File Cabinet	2

ALTERNATE (IF ANY)

DELIVERY DATE

PROMPT PAYMENT DISCOUNT (if

Tenansco?			
1	\$508.00	\$11,176.00	\$11,946.00

Lacasse			
2	\$199.00	\$398.00	\$468.00

Global

45 DAYS

N/A

Same Item	
2	\$550.00 \$12,100.00

Same Item	
4	\$480.00 \$960.00

Same Item

NLT 75 DAYS ARO

N/A

Lyon			
4	\$634.95	\$13,968.90	\$13,829.21

Global Total Office			
1	\$228.37	\$456.74	\$452.17

Global Total Office

6 WEEKS

1% WITHIN 10 DAYS

3	\$590.65	\$12,994.30
---	----------	-------------

CUSTOM -SEE	
3	NO BID

4 WEEKS

N/A

Safco			
5	\$723.50	\$15,917.00	\$15,757.83

Hon			
3	\$391.50	\$783.00	\$775.17

Hon

6 WEEKS

1 % WITHIN 15 DAYS